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Abstract 

The current scientific research is studies an administrative structure in order to optimize the activities and the 
overall management. It aims at establishing duplicate functions in the organization under study. The main 
tasks in the analysis are related to the display of the basic findings and conclusions for the strongest sides 
and the fields for improvement regarding the relevance, the effectiveness and the efficiency on 
administration of the Commission on Protection against Discrimination. The following areas are thoroughly 
and critically analyzed: relevance of the functions and efficiency of the activity. As a result of the study a 
Strategy for Organizational Development and a Training Plan have been drafted. 
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1 SECTION  

The current report presents the results of the functional analysis of the current situation of the Commission 
for Protection against Discrimination (CPD) of the Republic of Bulgaria 

The purpose of the functional analysis is based on a study and assessment of the relevance of the functions, 
the effectiveness and the efficiency of the Commission to highlight the main findings on the strengths and the 
areas for improvement. 

The tasks that are formulated relate to the achievement of the main purpose of the analysis and include 
analysis of the following areas: 

•  Relevance of the functions in the CPD; 

•  Effectiveness of the CPD activity; 

• Efficiency of the CPD activity. 

This functional analysis covers the CPD without analyzing the functions of other authorities with powers in 
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the field of protection against discrimination and equality. 

The following limitations have been taken into account in the process of the drafting of the analysis: 

Analysis of the effectiveness 

• The fact that the CPD does not have a defined vision for development and there are no documents 
defining the strategic and annual objectives of the institution and of the respective structural units is 
considered as a limitation of the analysis. 

•  In relation to the above, the CPD does not have defined indicators for measuring the implementation of 
strategic, annual and operational objectives. 

• In the framework of the administration there are no procedures for strategic and annual planning, 
performance monitoring, preparation of the annual report of the activity. 

 Efficiency analysis 

•  The Commission does not have an information system for reporting the results of the activity in a way 
that allows systematic and reliable aggregation of information on given indicators. The main results of the 
activity are based on the Commission's Annual Reports. 

•  For the analysis is used the provided information on the staff remuneration costs at the organizational 
level as well as the wages of the regional representatives. 

• CPD does not apply program budgeting but only develops budget by economic elements. Therefore, 
financial-accounting information, it is not possible to value inputs in order to achieve basic performance of 
activity of the administration by units/function administration, on the basis of which to be calculated the 
corresponding degree of efficiency. The approach used is to calculate the efficiency at the organizational 
level by using the information received on staff remuneration and effective work time. 

• At the time of the conducting the present analysis, an audit by the National Audit Office is being carried 
out within the administration, so the report on the auditing and certification of the AFO of the CPD for 2014 is 
still not validated and published. For analyzing the implementation of the 2014 budget has been used the 
version of the non-certified financial report provided by the CPD. 

• No information on the number of days worked by each of the regional representatives per year has been 
reported, as the software used by the CPD does not allow the generation of such a report. 

The functional analysis was carried out in 2015.A Unified methodology for conducting a functional analysis in 
the state administration, approved by the Council of Ministers and published on the Public Consultation 
Portal at the Council of Ministers is being applied. In addition, the LEAN methodology is being applied. 

The methods used to perform analysis of the current status include: 

• Collecting, researching and analyzing normative acts, strategic and internal documents in order to 
establish the powers of the authority, the functions of the administration, the objectives set, the achieved 
results and the resources that have been used. 

• poll surveys through preliminary developed questionnaires for managers and staff. The questionnaires 
were presented to officials and managers from the administration through a specially used internet-based 
software product. As a result, 44 responses were received, representing 58% of the total number of the 
administration; 

• conducting of interviews with managers and employees of the CPD in the period 29 - 30 April 2015. The 
interviews were structured with a focus on collecting additional information on issues related to the activity of 
relevant units - relevance; 

• of the functions, the setting of objectives, performance reporting, the resource security, etc .; 

• the holding of a meeting with the working group of experts, designated by the CPD on 15 May 2015; 

• observations and expert evaluation of the results of the documentary analysis, the survey researches, the 
interviews and the focus groups by an expert team. 

Relevance analysis 

Objectives of the Relevance Analysis 

The objectives of the analysis of relevance, according to the Uniform Methodology for conducting functional 
analysis in the state administration, include: 



IJASOS- International E-Journal of Advances in Social Sciences, Vol. IV, Issue 10, April 2018 
 

 http://ijasos.ocerintjournals.org 8 

 

• identifying the policy areas for which the authority is responsible; 

• identifying, grouping and analyzing the powers of the authority; 

• identification and grouping of the functions of the structural units in the administration; 

• an analysis of the relevance of the functions of the directorates and departments according to the policy 
areas for which the authority is responsible and its powers, the establishment of atypical functions that can 
be deduced from the administration; 

• analysis of the vertical and horizontal positioning of the functions of the internal units in order to observe 
the requirements of the normative acts, the presence of completely or partially duplicate functions, the 
existence of internal units that can be closed or restructured. 

Analysis of the current state 

Identification of the policy areas for which the authority is responsible 

On the basis of the legislation providing for the powers of the CPD as an independent state authority, the 
following two main policy areas can be identified: 

• Policy Area 1: Protection against discrimination and ensuring of equality; 

• Policy Area 2: Prevention of Discrimination; 

These policy areas cover all the special powers of the Commission under the legislative framework, which 
are implemented through three types of functions: 

• Preventive function; 

• Protective function; 

• Control function. 

Identifying the powers of the authority specified in the legislation 

The assignment of powers to the authority is the key initial moment in the process of organizational, 
functional and administrative structuring of the particular administration, as the main purpose of such 
structuring is to support the realization of these powers.  

Each authority has two main categories of powers: 

• Powers of the Head of the Administrative Structure (General Powers); 

• Powers which are related to the special competence of the authority (Special Powers). 

In this regard, the present report examines the following powers of the CPD, arising from the Protection 
against Discrimination Act (PaDA) and the Rules of the Structure and Activity of the CPD (RSACPD): 

• powers of the CPD chair, arising from his position as head of the administrative structure; 

• powers of the Commission and its members, related to its special competence as an independent state 
body with jurisdictional powers. 

The Commission for Protection against Discrimination is a legal entity on budget support - a first-level budget 
spender. The Commission has its headquarters in Sofia and has its own regional representatives, and the 
conditions and order for the determination of the territorial structure of the administration of the authority are 
governed by the RSACPD. 

On the basis of the legislation on the management of the administrative structures and the personnel, the 
following main areas of competence of the CPD chair can be identified as the head of the administrative 
structure: 

• Human resources management; 

• Management of financial resources; 

• Property management; 

• Management of defense mobilization training; 

• Information security; 

• Administrative services; 
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• Information Systems, Record Keeping; 

• Legality of the activity; 

• Publicity of the activity and protocol. 

As regards of the special powers, CPD is an independent, specialized state body for preventing 
discrimination, protecting against discrimination and ensuring equality of the opportunities. The Commission 
exercises control over the implementation and observance of PaDA or other laws governing equal treatment. 

According to Art. 47 (1) to (12) of the PaDA, the Commission carries out its activities by: 

find out violations of this and other laws, which regulate the equality of treatment, the offender and the 
affected person;   

• state prevention from and termination of the violation and restoration of the initial situation;  

• impose the provided sanctions and enforce administrative compulsory measures; 

• issue obligatory prescriptions for compliance with this and other laws, which regulate the equality of 
treatment;  

• appeal against the administrative acts, which are in contravention to this and other laws, which regulate 
the equal treatment, initiate claims before the court and act as a concerned party in proceedings under this 
and other laws, which regulate the equal treatment; 

• issue proposals and recommendations to the state and local self-government bodies to terminate 
discrimination practices and to revoke their acts, which have been issued in contravention to this and other 
laws, which regulate the equal treatment; 

• maintain a public register of the adopted and entered in force decisions and obligatory prescriptions; 

• issue statements on the conformity of the legal act drafts with the legislation for prevention of 
discrimination, as well as recommendations for adopting, revoking, amending and supplementing legal acts;  

• provide independent assistance to the victims of discrimination in constituting complaints against 
discrimination;  

• conduct independent researches related to discrimination;  

• publish independent reports and provide recommendations on all issues related to discrimination; 

• carry out other competencies, provided in the Rules of Procedure.   

Also, according to art. 40, para 5 of PaDA, CPD shall report annually to the National Assembly on its 
activities not later than March 31 of the following year, which also includes information about the activities of 
each of its permanent specialized panels.  

The RSACPD complements and specifies the specific competencies of the collective body defined by PaDA. 
Along with the above powers, the Commission: interacts with other state bodies and institutions, local 
authorities, as well as non-governmental organizations through opinions or participation in the development 
of draft regulations, exchange of information and other forms of cooperation;  

• monitors the compliance with the PADA and also with its secondary legislation of anti-discrimination 
provisions and with new legislation in the country;  

• monitors and takes measures the Bulgarian anti-discrimination legislation to correspond to the EU 
legislation and the International law;  

• carries out and coordinates international cooperation in the field of anti-discrimination policy of the 
Republic of Bulgaria with international bodies and organizations, as well with similar foreign institutions;  

• gives opinions on draft legislation concerning equal treatment;  

• adopts rules for the proceedings before it.  

• shall adopt internal rules, instructions and methodological guidelines relating to the operational and 
control activities of the Commission;  

• shall adopt the organizational structure, staff and internal rules for salary;  

• shall adopt a draft budget for each year thereafter;  
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• shall adopt the annual report on the activities of the Commission.  

Grouping of powers of the authority defined in the legislation and the functions of the CPD 

In accordance with the Unified Functional Analysis Methodology, in the context of this analysis, the powers 
of the authority - CPD identified in the laws and in the sub legislative acts are grouped according to the 
defined two policy areas. 

In general, explicit regulation of rights, duties and responsibilities of the CPD is identified in 1 law, 5 sub 
legislative acts and 1 non-normative act of the Council of Ministers. 

Policy area 2 "Prevention of Discrimination" has the most extensive regulation - special powers of the CPD 
are defined in 1 law, 5 sub- legislative acts and one non-normative act of the Council of Ministers, while 
within Policy Area 1 "Protection against Discrimination and ensuring equality " there is a regulation in 1 law 
and 1 sub-legislative acts .However, account should be taken of the fact that within Policy Area 1 PaDA, 
commits to the CPD to exercise control over the application of other laws governing equal treatment (Article 
40 (2) of the PaDA), without explicit listing, which leads to uncertainty about the full scope of the powers 
within the that competence. It is advisable to carry out a detailed review of the national legislation with a view 
to identify acts and norms relating to equal treatment as a basis for supplementing and specifying the 
functions of the CPD in the Rules of the Structure and the Activities. 

The aforementioned figures for the number of normative acts refer only to the main normative acts in which 
the special powers of the authority are outlined. 

Other acts where the powers of the collective body or the chair of the Commission are further developed in 
relation to their technical implementation and are not the subject of this analysis (for example, internal rules 
of procedure before the CPD). 

Number of legislative acts by policy area 

Prevention of discriminationI     Protection against discrimination and ensuring equality  

0  1  2   3   4   5   6   7   8 

■ Laws ■ Sub-legeslative Acts ■ Non-normative acts 

Source: KPMG Bulgaria 

Figure 1. Number of acts by areas of special powers of the CPD (policy areas) 

In connection with these circumstances, the purpose of the analysis is to clarify the extent to which the 
administration assisting the exercising of all the powers of the authority is structured in a way that adequately 
reflects the "sectoral profile" of the collective body - the CPD. 

Classification of powers / functions of the authority on policy areas 

In accordance with the Unified Methodology for conducting a functional analysis and for the purpose of 
eventual finding of competencies, not typical for the CPD as an independent specialized state body, was 
used Classification of the Functions of Government (COFOG), given by the Organization for Economic 
Cooperation and Development (OECD) in the following categories: 

 Functions of sectoral policy - strategic planning, drafting of legislation, development of minimum 
standards, standards of analysis and assessment of sectoral policy, forecasting. 

 Functions for provision of services - providing of services to internal (other state bodies) or external 
(business, citizens, media, trade unions) clients; 

 Regulatory functions - Within the classification, regulatory functions include functions to verify and monitor 
compliance with the legal provisions. Similar functions are inherent to central executive authorities, as well 
as to specialized committees. Regulatory functions may also include issuing of licenses, certificates, issuing 
of permits, accreditation, inspections, financial audit. 

 Functions of coordination, supervision and control - coordination of relations between different authorities 
monitoring of  the activities of accountable (subordinate) structures, supporting these structures for achieving 
their goals; 

Supportive functions - accounting, recordkeeping, human resources management, information systems, public 
relations, organizational infrastructure, staff training, efficacy analysis and audit management, secretarial 
services.The overall distribution of the special powers by type of the CPD functions is presented in Figure 2 
(Functions of sectoral policy -44%; Functions for provision of services – 4%; Regulatory functions -22%; 
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Functions of coordination, supervision and control -15% and Supportive functions 15%). 

 

Figure 2. General distribution of the CPD's special competence according to the OECD classification 

The largest is the share of sectoral policy functions (12 functions, 44%), but mainly concentrated in Policy 
Area 2: Prevention of Discrimination (a total of 11 out of 12 functions of sector policy). Here, it should be 
noted that the functions that are defined as sectoral policies are categorized to some degree conditionally. In 
principle, in order to determine whether a body of authority conducts a comprehensive and complete sectoral 
policy it is necessary to include it legally at all stages of the implementation of the specific policy: the 
identifying of the problems (the public relations for state regulation); policy formation; developing of toolkits; 
decision making; execution; analysis and evaluation with a view to decision making for continuation, 
correction or suspension of the policy. In this sense, the CPD does not have the full set of powers to self-
implement the sectoral policy in the field of prevention and protection against discrimination. 

The functions that may be assigned to the sectoral policy category are the following: the functions of a 
consultative body with regard to the country's prevention policy; the review of legislation on compliance with 
the anti-discrimination rules; provision of competent opinions and participation in working groups on drafting 
of legislative acts, participation in advisory councils on social inclusion, ethnic issues, national human rights 
coordination mechanism, program monitoring committees, co-financed by EU structural and investment 
funds and others, including the preparation of specialized analyzes and reports on issues related to the 
prevention and the protection against discrimination. 

The second largest group of special powers are the regulatory functions (6 functions, 22%), which is a 
consequence of the specific competence of the CPD, related to the control over the compliance with the 
provisions of PaDA, including establishing and sanctioning of violations, control over the implementation of 
the decisions, the conciliation agreements and the coercive administrative measures. 

Practically, the regulatory functions (verification and monitoring of compliance with legislation) most closely 
reflect the specificities of the CPD as a specialized independent state authority with jurisdictional powers in 
the field of protection against discrimination. It should be borne in mind that the percentage ratio which 
places the regulatory functions in second place does not necessarily reflect the actual functional load of the 
CPD. Their number, compared to the number of sectoral policy functions is smaller on the basis of simple 
calculation, as regulatory functions are represented in high-level regulatory acts. The specific activities 
carried out by the Commission in the anti-discrimination proceedings (for example, admissibility checks, 
regularity and fitness of the complaints and signals, actions in the inquiry procedure, in the hearing phase 
and other actions that take place on the basis of procedural rules defined in the law) are not included in the 
general calculation of regulatory functions, as they can not be defined as functions but as working 
processes. 

The next group of special powers ate the functions fore coordination, control and supervision (4 functions, 
15%) allocated equally between the two identified policy areas. This group includes specific functions related 
to the control of the CPD on the activities of other state bodies and municipalities, cooperation with other 
bodies as well as the coordinating role of the Commission for the implementation of international cooperation 
in the field of the anti-discrimination policy of the country. 

The supportive functions that fall within the group of special powers (outside the typical functions of the 
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general administration, such as accounting, record keeping, information systems, etc.) are 4 functions, 15%. 
Here fall the functions of keeping the public register of the issued and enforced decisions and the binding 
prescriptions of the Commission, the informing of the public through the media about the current provisions 
in the field of protection 

against discrimination, as well as the functions related to the elaboration of rules of procedure before the 
CPD and other internal rules, instructions and methodological instructions related to the operational and 
control activities of the CPD. 

Fewer are the service provision functions (1 function, 4%), which is related to the provision of independent 
legal assistance to victims of discrimination in the submission of complaints to the Commission. 

Of the examined types of functions, half are assigned by sub-legislative acts (mainly RSACPD). This is due 
to the perception in the PaDA approach to refer to the RSACPD for additional functions and powers of the 
CPD. 

The distribution of the types of functions by policy area shows that the functions within Policy Area 1: 
protection against discrimination and ensuring of equality are most varied. In this area of policy, the CPD has 
functions in the field of sectoral policy, service provision, regulation, coordination, control and supervision 
and supporting functions. The largest is share of regulatory functions, which are concentrated only in this 
area. 

Policy Area 2: Prevention of Discrimination consists essentially of sectoral policy functions complemented by 
2 functions for coordination, control and supervision functions and 1 supporting function within the framework 
of the special powers of the authority. 

The main share of supportive functions is concentrated in Policy Area 1: protection against discrimination 
and ensuring of equality. It should be noted as a good practice that the total number of supportive functions 
(not typical of the general administration) is not large, thus preserving the focus of the CPD's work on the 
core set of specific powers that are entrusted to it. 

The drafted categorization of policy areas and typology by function can be used as a basis for possible 
changes in the organizational structure of the CPD administration. 

 Other authorities related to the same/related policy areas 

 Bellow are outlined theauthorities and other organizations that have substantial role in the implementation 
of the two main policy areas of the CPD. 

 Ombudsman of the Republic of Bulgaria - the Ombudsman is a body that advocates when acts or 
omissions affect or violate the rights and freedoms of citizens by the state and the municipal authorities and 
their administrations as well as by the persons entrusted with the provision of public services In its activity, 
the Ombudsman adopts and reviews complaints and signals of violations of rights and freedoms by the state 
and municipal authorities and their administrations, makes proposals and recommendations for the 
restoration of the violated rights and freedoms to the respective bodies, mediates between administrative 
bodies and the affected persons and recommends removing of the causes and conditions that create 
preconditions for violations of rights and freedoms; 

 Ministry of Labor and Social Policy - in connection with the implementation of the national policy on 
equality between men and women, as well as ensuring the equality of people with disabilities; 

 Ministry of Education - cooperation on ensuring equal access to education, including support for the 
development of sectoral strategies related to the integration of representatives of minority groups and 
disadvantaged people within the education system; 

 Ministry of Foreign Affairs - cooperation in the framework of activities of international organizations in 
which the Republic of Bulgaria is a member state; 

 National Council for Cooperation on Ethnic and Integration Issues at the Council of Ministers - CPD 
assists the National Council in proposing measures for the implementation of the national policy in the field 
of protection against ethnic discrimination (Article 3, item 9 of the Rules for Organization and Activities of the 
National Council on Ethnic and Integration Issues); 

 Ministry of the Interior - Ministry of Interior assists the CPD in the collection of evidence in the framework 

Public Works, “National Construction Control” Directorate and municipalities - in relation to the functions of 
providing accessible environment for the population and people with disabilities in accordance with the 



IJASOS- International E-Journal of Advances in Social Sciences, Vol. IV, Issue 10, April 2018 
 

 http://ijasos.ocerintjournals.org 13 

 

provisions of the Spatial Development Act and Ordinance № 4 from 01.07.2009 on the Design, 
Implementation and Maintenance of Buildings in accordance with the requirements of an accessible 
environment for the population, including people with disabilities. 

It should be noted that the order for organizing and implementing the cooperation and external 
communication links of the CPD with other authorities is extremely low in the framework of the RSACPD and 
there is no explicit regulation regarding the specific functions and the responsible units within the 
administration. Such gaps can lead to gaps and delays in the interaction process, which in turn hinders the 
implementation of the Commission's statutory powers. In this respect, it is necessary to develop a 
mechanism, including the areas, the specific functions and the responsible units, which carry out the 
interactions of the Commission with other authorities. 

Evaluation of the quality of external communication and coordination links 

In the framework of the survey carried out, the heads of administrative units of the CPD assess the 
timeliness and the reliability of the communications and the coordination with the external administrations. A 
large number of employees (52.5%) are of the opinion that the timeliness and reliability of the CPD's external 
communication and coordination links are good, while 15% indicate that there are omissions, both in terms of 
reliability and timeliness. 12.5% of the respondents indicate shortcomings in terms of timeliness and 10% 
indicate that the term and the reliability are not at the required level, which creates prerequisites for poor 
fulfillment of the obligations as good (100%). 

The current scientific research is studies an administrative structure in order to optimize the activities and the 
overall management. It aims at establishing duplicate functions in the organization under study. The main 
tasks in the analysis are related to the display of the basic findings and conclusions for the strongest sides 
and the fields for improvement regarding the relevance, the effectiveness and the efficiency on 
administration of the Commission on Protection against Discrimination. The following areas are thoroughly 
and critically analyzed: relevance of the functions and efficiency of the activity. As a result of the study a 
Strategy for Organizational Development and a Training Plan have been drafted (Terziev, Dzhumalieva, 
Parvanov, 2017; Zhelezarov, 2009; Zhelezarov, 2008; Zhelezarov, Hristov, 2007a; Zhelezarov, Hristov, 
2007a; Zhelezarov, Hristov, 2007b; Zhelezarov, 2006a; Zhelezarov, 2006b; Zhelezarov, 2005a; Zhelezarov, 
2005b; Zhelezarov, 2005c; Zhelezarov, 2004; Zhelezarov, Hristov, 2003a; Zhelezarov, 2003b; Nikolov, 
Nemigenchev, Zhelezarov, 2002; Zhelezarov, 2001a; Zhelezarov, 2001b; Ivanov, Zhelezarov, 1998a; 
Ivanov, Zhelezarov, 1998b; Ivanov, Zhelezarov,1997). 
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